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NO. CONDITIONS OF APPROVAL Agency Source 
Compliance 

Verification 

GENERAL 

1.  These Conditions of Approval are being 
imposed on a Tentative Tract Map for a four-
story, five-unit mixed use building currently 
under construction (the “Project”), for the 
property located at 12712-12718 Washington 
Boulevard (the “Property”). 
 

All Standard  

2.  a. The final map shall be prepared by a licensed 
engineer or surveyor authorized to prepare 
maps by the State of California and submitted to 
the Los Angeles County Department of Public 
Works for review and approval of the technical 
aspects of the map.  A copy of the first plan 
check package as submitted to Los Angeles 
County shall also be submitted concurrently to 
the Culver City Engineering Division for review 
along with the administrative review fee.  
 
b. A preliminary title report and subdivision 
guarantee shall be submitted showing all fee 
interest holders, all interest holders whose 
interest could ripen into a fee, all trust deeds, 
together with the names of the trustee and all 
easement holders.  The account for this title 
report shall remain open until the final map is 
filed with the County Recorder.  No easements 
shall be granted and recorded until after the final 
map is recorded, unless approved by the City 
Engineer and subordinated to any City 
easements by a certification upon the title sheet 
of the final map, prior to the grant. 
 
c. The final map shall comply with all 
requirements of the State of California 
Subdivision Map Act, as most recently 
amended. 
 
d. All required boundary monuments shall be 
installed prior to the recordation of the final 
map.  At a minimum, a spike and washer, or 
other approved monument, shall be placed on 

Public 
Works 

Special  



EXHIBIT A 

RESOLUTION NO. 2016-P010 

Tentative Tract Map, P2016-0070-TTM 

 12712 – 12718 Washington Boulevard 

 

Page 2 of 3 

 

the prolongation of the northerly property line 
and the centerline of Washington Boulevard. 
 
e. All centerline monuments shall be tied to at 
least four points.  Centerline tie notes shall be 
submitted to the City Engineer prior to the 
approval of the map. 
 
f. The Tentative Map shall expire thirty-six (36) 
months after its approval or conditional approval 
by the City Council. 
 
g. The final map shall be recorded prior to the 
issuance of any Certificate of Occupancy for any 
residential air space unit. 

3.  All access easements and covenants with 
adjacent properties shall remain in effect and in 
force.  

Public 
Works 

Planning 

Special  

4.  All permits and licenses required in connection 
with the development or use of the Project shall 
be applied for and obtained separately and shall 
be consistent with Conditions of Approval for the 
mixed use project administratively approved on 
January 10, 2013 (ASPR P-2010100 and AUP 
P-2010101) and Building Permit No. 85856. 
 

All Standard/ 
Special 

 

5.  Changes to the Project or use approved as part 
of the Land Use Permit may only be made in 
accordance with the provisions of CCMC 
Section 17.595.035 – “Changes to an Approved 
Project”. 
 

Planning Standard  

6.  The project shall comply with CCMC Section 
17.400.065 – “Mixed Use Development 
Standards.” 

Planning Special  

7.  All provisions, and requirements set forth in 
these Conditions of Approval, in the CCMC, or 
in any applicable written comments as provided 
by City representatives on November 17, 2011 
at the Project Review Committee meeting on the 
Land Use Permit application, shall be fulfilled 
and satisfied to the satisfaction of all City 
departments before the use may be established 
or the Project occupied. 

All Standard  
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8.  The use and development of the Property shall 
be in substantial conformance with the plans 
and materials submitted with the application for 
the Tentative Tract Map as approved by the 
Planning Commission on July 27, 2016, except 
as modified by these Conditions of Approval.   
 

Planning Standard  

9.  The use and development of the Property shall 
comply with these Conditions of Approval and all 
applicable local, special district or authority, 
county, state and federal statutes, codes, 
standards, and regulations including, but not 
limited to, Building Division, Fire Department, 
Planning Division and Public Works Department 
requirements, and shall comply with all 
applicable CCMC requirements and all 
comments made during the City’s building 
permit plan check review process. Failure to 
comply with said Conditions, statutes, codes, 
standards, and regulations may result in 
reconstruction work, demolition, stop work 
orders, withholding of certificate of occupancy, 
revocation of land use permit approval and/or 
any other lawful action the City might deem 
reasonable and appropriate to bring about 
compliance. 
 

All Standard  
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